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September 6, 2024 
U.S. Department of Labor        
Employment and Training Administration, Office of Unemployment Insurance 
Room S-4519 
200 Constitution Ave. NW 
Washington, DC 20210 
 
Submitted via email: OUI-PRA@dol.gov; 

Subject: Information collection request on Claims and Payment Activities 

The National Employment Law Project (NELP) submits this comment in support of proposed revisions to the 
Department of Labor's (DOL) Employment and Training Administration (ETA) form 5159, which would collect 
data on unemployment insurance (UI) claims and payments using updated definitions for race or ethnicity, sex 
and/or gender, level of educational attainment, as well as a new field capturing incomplete claims.  

We further recommend expanding the information collection request to include data on claimants’ preferred 
language, disability status, military status, and geography of residence (urban/suburban/rural) in order to 
provide additional insight on disparities in UI claims and payments.  

NELP is a nonprofit research, policy, and capacity building organization that for more than 50 years has 
sought to strengthen protections and build power for workers in the U.S., including workers who are 
unemployed. For decades, NELP has researched and advocated for policies that create good jobs, expand 
access to work, and strengthen protections and support for underpaid and jobless workers. 

As detailed further below, racial and ethnic disparities in UI take-up and recipiency rates are dramatic. For 
example, researchers consistently find that unemployed Black workers are substantially less likely to receive 
unemployment benefits than their white counterparts, even after accounting for differences in eligibility.1 
Collecting enhanced demographic data on ETA form 5159, including data on initial and continuing claims, 
weeks and amounts compensated, first, and final payments, as well as incomplete claims, will be of great 
practical utility, enabling state workforce agencies, state and federal legislators, advocates, and researchers 
to better understand the nature of these disparities. The data will help stakeholders understand the cause of 
these disparities and how they may best be addressed to provide equitable access to UI programs. Data on 
incomplete claims is especially important for understanding which demographic groups, in which states, 
encounter the most significant barriers in completing the UI claims process. 

Given the existing disparities in UI recipiency and take-up, the proposed collection of information is vital to the 
proper performance of the functions of DOL-ETA to “ensure full payment of unemployment compensation 
when due”2 and to “assure the correctness and verification” of reports on UI administration submitted by 
states.3 The additional data collection is also necessary to comply with the Government Accountability Office 
(GAO)’s recommendation that DOL report on racial and ethnic inequities in the regular UI benefit program4 
and to improve equitable access to UI programs as outlined in DOL’s Equity Access Plan.5 
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Proposed Information Collection is Needed to Understand and Reduce Disparities 
UI is a critical lifeline for unemployed and underemployed workers and their families at all economic times. 
During economic downturns it also provides effective support to local communities, bolsters consumer 
demand that businesses depend on, and strengthens the nation’s economy as a whole. Yet most unemployed 
workers never file for or successfully claim UI benefits, preventing the UI system from reaching its full potential 
to support workers and the economy. In 2023, just 29 percent of unemployed workers received UI benefits.6 
Collecting data on race or ethnicity, sex and/or gender, and level of educational attainment in state claims and 
payment activities will enable state and federal policymakers, including DOL itself, to better understand the 
barriers that prevent workers from different demographic groups from accessing UI benefits and begin to 
reduce these barriers. 
 
Racial and ethnic disparities in UI recipiency rates are severe. As a result of structural racism in U.S. labor 
markets, Black, Indigenous, and Latinx workers are consistently more likely to be unemployed than non-
Hispanic white workers. 7 Unemployment rates among Black workers are frequently twice as high as those of 
their white counterparts, a disparity that persists even after accounting for gender, age, and education.8 Yet 
unemployed Black workers are less likely to be eligible for or to receive unemployment benefits when they are 
eligible.9 One recent study finds that unemployed Black workers were consistently 24 percent less likely to 
receive unemployment benefits than their white counterparts over a span of 30 years.10  
 
Disparities in UI recipiency rates among states contribute to racial inequity: In the southeastern states that are 
home to the largest shares of Black workers, policymakers have implemented the most restrictive UI eligibility 
and access rules, consistently producing the nation’s lowest recipiency rates.11 These racial disparities 
persisted even when federal pandemic UI programs temporarily expanded eligibility.12 
 
In addition to racial and ethnic disparities, research consistently finds that older workers, more highly 
educated workers, and union members are more likely to receive UI benefits than their younger, less 
educated, or nonunion counterparts.13 Gender is a less consistent predictor of UI benefit receipt, however it is 
important to track data on sex and/or gender to detect, monitor, and address any disparities that may arise. 
Collecting data on UI claims and payments on race or ethnicity, sex and/or gender, and level of educational 
attainment will be of great utility in assessing each of these disparities.  
 
Incomplete claims data will help detect barriers to UI access 
In the course of our close collaboration with legal services practitioners that assist workers with their UI 
claims, NELP frequently learns of the numerous roadblocks that workers face in completing an initial claim for 
UI benefits. While the jammed phone lines and crashing websites that characterized the early days of the 
COVID-19 pandemic have now been greatly improved, numerous obstacles remain, including confusing 
language on UI applications, limited accessibility on mobile devices, inadequate translation and interpretation 
services, and insufficient support for workers with disabilities or limited technological proficiency. 

In addition to these longstanding barriers, during the pandemic some states adopted burdensome identity 
verification procedures that make it difficult, if not impossible, for many workers to access the benefits to 
which they are entitled.14 Collecting data on incomplete claims, along with the demographic data requested in 
this notice, will help to identify which demographic groups, in which states, are experiencing the most 
significant barriers to completing an initial UI claim. Better understanding incomplete claims will enable 
policymakers to address these barriers, facilitating the ongoing efforts of states and DOL-ETA to improve UI 
access. 

Additional data collection would identify disparities and promote equitable access  



 

 

 

 

In 2023, NELP worked with more than 30 experts and stakeholders to develop a set of proposed performance 
standards for equitable access to unemployment insurance.15 Stakeholders highlighted disparities in UI claims 
and payment activities they found in their own work, including barriers to UI access for workers with limited 
English proficiency, workers with disabilities, veterans, and workers in rural areas. Expanding data collection 
to obtain claim and payment information about these additional demographics would improve the ability of the 
UI system to serve these underserved workers, complementing DOL-ETA’s existing efforts to improve 
equitable access to UI. 

For example, monthly data on claims and payment activity would enhance states’ understanding of barriers to 
UI access for workers with disabilities. Although the highest ever recorded percentage of people with 
disabilities were employed in 2023, workers with disabilities were still more than twice as likely to be 
unemployed than workers without a disability (7.2 percent compared to 3.5 percent).16 Despite the higher 
unemployment rate, unemployed workers with a disability were less likely to apply for UI benefits than their 
counterparts without disabilities. Of 342,000 unemployed workers with a disability, 20 percent applied for 
benefits compared to an application rate of 26.4 percent for workers without a disability.17 

Similarly, claims and payment activity data about language preference would enable policymakers to better 
serve workers with limited English proficiency. Although civil rights laws require translation and interpretation 
of public benefits information into commonly understood languages, and DOL-ETA’s equitable access efforts 
have helped many states to improve language access, a number of states still fail to provide essential UI 
notices, forms, and applications in the languages understood by workers in their states. This makes it difficult 
for workers with limited English proficiency to apply for benefits, comply with ongoing eligibility requirements, 
or contest disputed cases. Language access barriers likely contribute to disparities in applying for and 
receiving UI benefits between foreign-born and U.S.-born workers.18  

Additional data collection on payment and claims by military status (especially since not all veterans qualify for 

Unemployment Compensation for Ex-Service Members) and geography of residence (urban/suburban/rural) 

would offer additional insight on disparities in UI claims and payments. Geographic information could be 

collected by requiring states to report applicant zip codes. 

 

In conclusion, NELP strongly supports DOL-ETA’s proposed information collection request. The additional 

data will allow DOL to better comply with agency performance requirements set forth in the Social Security Act 

and as recommended by the GAO. These data are of great practical utility in advancing equitable access to UI 

benefits. In furtherance of this goal, and in addition to DOL-ETA’s proposed request, we recommend 

collecting information on claimants’ preferred language, disability status, military status, and geography of 

residence (urban/suburban/rural). This will ensure that DOL and stakeholders better understand the nature of 

disparities in access to UI benefits and how to address them. 

  

Sincerely, 

Amy M. Traub 
Senior Research and Policy Analyst 
National Employment Law Project 
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